Bid #011.20.B3 9/17/2019
Concrete Contractor Services 11:01 AM
Bid Tab
District Colossal E.A.R.N. Highland Turf-
SFMS. LLC ATK Services Construction,
Inc. Contractors, Inc. | Contractors, Inc. | HTI Contractors
Remove & Replace Area Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
1 [4" Concrete Pad 0-250 sq. ft. $10.04 $20.00 $20.00 $10.00 $14.00 $16.50
2 |4" Concrete Pad 251-500 sq. ft. $9.50 $18.00 $19.50 $10.00 $14.00 $13.50
3 |4" Concrete Pad 501-1250 sq. ft. $7.25 $15.00 $18.00 $10.00 $14.00 $12.50
4 |6" Concrete Pad 0-250 sq. ft. $13.10 $21.00 $23.00 $12.00 $16.00 $15.00
5 |6" Concrete Pad 251-500 sq. ft. $11.20 $19.00 $21.00 $12.00 $16.00 $17.50
6 |ADA Ramp 0-250 sq. ft. $11.20 $20.50 $24.00 $35.00 $45.00 $18.00
7 |ADA Ramp 251-500 sq. ft. $11.20 $18.50 $23.00 $35.00 $45.00 $15.00
8 [Concrete Curb & Gutter 0-50 In. ft. $76.00 $175.00 $55.00 $30.00 $45.00 $51.00
9 |Concrete Curb & Gutter 51-100 In. ft. $57.00 $150.00 $51.00 $30.00 $45.00 $49.00
10 |[Concrete Curb & Gutter 101+ In. ft. $37.00 $125.00 $50.00 $30.00 $45.00 $45.00
Unit Pricing for removal of
existing subgrade and
providing CR-6 more than
the amounts noted on the
drawings and shown in the
11 |[base bid. ton $225.00 $50.00 $120.00 $800.00 $900.00 $70.00
Concrete Slab Raising Area
Lift Concrete Pad Less than 2" in. Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
1 Lift Concrete Pad 0-500 sq. ft. $5.00 $9.00 $21.00 $20.00 $29.00 No Bid
2 Lift Concrete Pad 501-1000 sq. ft. $5.00 $8.00 $20.00 $25.00 $29.00 No Bid
3 Lift Concrete Pad 1001-1500 sq. ft. $5.00 $7.00 $19.00 $25.00 $29.00 No Bid
4 Lift Concrete Pad 1501-2000 sq. ft. $5.00 $6.00 $18.00 $25.00 $29.00 No Bid
5 Lift Concrete Pad Greater than 2001 sq. ft. $5.00 $6.00 $17.00 $25.00 $29.00 No Bid
Lift Concrete Pad 2-3" inches Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
1 Lift Concrete Pad 0-500 sq. ft. $5.00 $10.00 $30.00 $20.00 $35.00 No Bid
2 Lift Concrete Pad 501-1000 sq. ft. $5.00 $9.00 $29.00 $25.00 $35.00 No Bid
3 Lift Concrete Pad 1001-1500 sq. ft. $5.00 $8.00 $28.00 $25.00 $35.00 No Bid
4 Lift Concrete Pad 1501-2000 sq. ft. $5.00 $7.00 $27.00 $25.00 $35.00 No Bid
5 Lift Concrete Pad Greater than 2001 sq. ft. $5.00 $7.00 $26.00 $25.00 $35.00 No Bid
Lift Concrete Pad 3-4" inches Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
1 Lift Concrete Pad 0-500 sq. ft. $5.00 $11.00 $40.00 $25.00 $45.00 No Bid
2 Lift Concrete Pad 501-1000 sq. ft. $5.00 $10.00 $39.00 $25.00 $45.00 No Bid
3 Lift Concrete Pad 1001-1500 sq. ft. $5.00 $9.00 $38.00 $35.00 $45.00 No Bid
4 Lift Concrete Pad 1501-2000 sq. ft. $5.00 $8.00 $37.00 $35.00 $45.00 No Bid
5 Lift Concrete Pad Greater than 2001 sq. ft. $5.00 $8.00 $36.00 $35.00 $45.00 No Bid
Joint Sealing:
Backing and Caulking Width Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
1 Installation Joint Sealants 3/8in. If. $1.25 $15.00 $15.00 $7.00 $8.00 No Bid
2 Installation Joint Sealants 1/2in. If. $1.75 $17.25 $17.00 $7.00 $9.00 No Bid
3 Installation Joint Sealants 3/4in. If. $2.00 $20.00 $19.00 $7.00 $12.00 No Bid
4 Installation Joint Sealants 1"in. If. $2.50 $22.50 $21.00 $10.00 $13.00 No Bid
5 Installation Joint Sealants 1.25in. If. $2.75 $24.00 $23.00 $12.00 $15.00 No Bid
6 Installation Joint Sealants 1.5in. If. $3.00 $26.25 $25.00 $12.00 $15.00 No Bid
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