
7/29/2019
Bid #002.20.B4 10:00 AM
Custodial Plastic Liners

Item Size Mil/Mic
Delivery 

Warehouse
Delivery 
Schools

Delivery 
Warehouse

Delivery 
Schools

Delivery 
Warehouse

Delivery 
Schools

Delivery 
Warehouse

Delivery 
Schools

Delivery 
Warehouse

Delivery 
Schools

1 24 x 33 Liner 12 mic $18.19 $21.19 No Bid No Bid $19.59 $25.47 $19.14 $24.14 $19.24 $23,088.00

2 40 x 48 Liner 14 mic $17.10 $20.10 No Bid No Bid $17.49 $22.74 $15.18 $20.18 $17.24 $22.24

3 38 x 58 Liner 1.5 mil $16.24 $19.24 $18.43 No Bid $21.93 $28.51 $15.68 $20.68 $20.98 $25.98

4 38 x 58 Liner 2 mil $18.00 $21.00 $19.55 No Bid $23.50 $30.55 $17.24 $22.24 $22.34 $27.34

Item Size Mil/Mic
Delivery 

Warehouse
Delivery 
Schools

Delivery 
Warehouse

Delivery 
Schools

Delivery 
Warehouse

Delivery 
Schools

Delivery 
Warehouse

Delivery 
Schools

Delivery 
Warehouse

Delivery 
Schools

1 24 x 33 Liner 12 mic $29.19 No Bid $44.81 $44.18 $16.35 No Bid $16.76 $18.52 $21.80 $22.30

2 40 x 48 Liner 14 mic $21.45 No Bid $30.18 $30.18 $25.13 No Bid $24.81 $27.40 $21.90 $22.40

3 38 x 58 Liner 1.5 mil $25.93 No Bid $34.85 $34.85 No Bid No Bid $26.77 $29.60 $24.50 $25.00

4 38 x 58 Liner 2 mil $26.54 No Bid $36.78 $36.78 $35.79 No Bid $22.36 $24.73 $24.55 $25.05

Item Size Mil/Mic
Delivery 

Warehouse
Delivery 
Schools

Delivery 
Warehouse

Delivery 
Schools

Delivery 
Warehouse

Delivery 
Schools

Delivery 
Warehouse

Delivery 
Schools

Delivery 
Warehouse

Delivery 
Schools

1 24 x 33 Liner 12 mic $17.16 $18.01 $30.03 $33.37 $19.40 No Bid $21.77 $21.77

2 40 x 48 Liner 14 mic $23.31 $25.04 $20.05 $22.28 $16.25 No Bid $27.20 $27.20

3 38 x 58 Liner 1.5 mil $20.22 $21.22 $25.05 $27.84 $18.75 No Bid $36.94 $36.94

4 38 x 58 Liner 2 mil $24.13 $25.32 $33.41 $37.12 $20.85 No Bid $46.88 $46.88

W.B. Mason

Fitch Dustdown Co. Detmik Janitorial Supply

Brady Industries Superior Supply Unipak Corp.

Bid Tab 

Central Poly All American Poly Global Packaging 
Solutions

Interboro packaging Dispose N' Save

Leonard Paper Tiles in Style DBA Taza 
Supplies

Weise Brothers
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