
Bid #003.20.B4 7/31/2019
Custodial Paper Products 10:00 AM
Bid Tab

Item Description
Delivery to 
Warehouse

Delivery to 
Schools

Delivery to 
Warehouse

Delivery to 
Schools

Delivery to 
Warehouse

Delivery to 
Schools

Delivery to 
Warehouse

Delivery to 
Schools

1 Jumbo Roll Towels, 8" inch, 800 ft. max $27.82 $28.50 $27.18 $27.18 $18.59 $19.51 $15.89 $17.04

2 Paper Towels, Single Fold $17.98 $18.50 $29.72 $29.72 $15.59 $16.36 $13.07 $14.00

3 Jumbo Rolled Toilet Tissue, 2 ply $23.47 $24.00 $33.90 $33.90 $17.15 $17.98 $18.81 $20.04

4 Toilet Tissue Paper, 2 ply $34.67 $35.20 $59.54 $59.54 $31.96 $33.33 $27.25 $29.15

5 Dipenser, Jumbo Roll Towel, 8" $51.76 $52.30 $56.36 $56.36 $46.49 $49.59 $33.25 $37.50

6 Dispenser, Jumbo Rolled Toilet Tissue Paper $17.65 $18.25 $11.36 $11.36 $27.85 $29.71 $13.75 $16.00

Item Description
Delivery to 
Warehouse

Delivery to 
Schools

Delivery to 
Warehouse

Delivery to 
Schools

Delivery to 
Warehouse

Delivery to 
Schools

Delivery to 
Warehouse

Delivery to 
Schools

1 Jumbo Roll Towels, 8" inch, 800 ft. max $16.09 $16.09 $15.77 $16.27 $16.64 $17.29 $32.08 $32.08

2 Paper Towels, Single Fold $13.52 $13.52 $16.50 $17.00 $15.00 $16.59 $32.48 $32.48

3 Jumbo Rolled Toilet Tissue, 2 ply $18.99 $18.99 $19.40 $19.90 $21.11 $23.34 $41.52 $41.52

4 Toilet Tissue Paper, 2 ply $27.55 $27.55 $29.75 $30.25 $29.88 $33.05 $68.32 $68.32

5 Dipenser, Jumbo Roll Towel, 8" Free Free $31.50 $32.00 $34.89 $38.59 $56.08 $56.08

6 Dispenser, Jumbo Rolled Toilet Tissue Paper Free Free $20.50 $21.00 $10.32 $11.41 $74.94 $74.94

Detmik Janitorial Supply Mill Supply Brady Industries S. Freedman & Sons

W.B. Mason Group GTE Fitch Dustdown
Tiles in Style LLC DBA 

Taza Supplies



Item Description
Delivery to 
Warehouse

Delivery to 
Schools

Delivery to 
Warehouse

Delivery to 
Schools

Delivery to 
Warehouse

Delivery to 
Schools

Delivery to 
Warehouse

Delivery to 
Schools

1 Jumbo Roll Towels, 8" inch, 800 ft. max $26.39 $26.39 $17.91 No Bid $16.03 $16.89

2 Paper Towels, Single Fold $29.15 $29.15 $14.93 No Bid $13.44 $14.17

3 Jumbo Rolled Toilet Tissue, 2 ply $27.49 $27.49 $21.72 No Bid $18.92 $19.94

4 Toilet Tissue Paper, 2 ply $49.50 $49.50 $30.68 No Bid $27.39 $28.89

5 Dipenser, Jumbo Roll Towel, 8" $68.97 $68.97 $39.00 No Bid $26.57 $26.83

6 Dispenser, Jumbo Rolled Toilet Tissue Paper $33.17 $33.17 $25.67 No Bid $17.55 $17.71

Cotinental & Global 
Services Leonard Paper FPC Holdings, Inc.




	Bid Tab

