
Bid Tab 3/30/2020
Bid #050.20.B3 10:01 AM
Three School-Select Exterior Door Replacements

Tito Contractors, Inc. Homerite of Baltimore A&S Unlimited 
Construction

Most Incorportated Nichols Contracting, 
Inc.

Overhead Door of 
Baltimore, Inc.

Centennial Elementary School

Base Bid $208,263.00 $150,702.00 $242,000.00 $153,758.00 $130,815.00 $128,500.00

Alternate 1 $11,485.00 $18,646.00 $14,000.00 $14,206.00 $7,730.00 $12,260.00

Alternate 2 $5,375.00 $8,286.00 $3,800.00 $6,698.00 $4,050.00 $9,060.00

Alternate 3 $5,375.00 $8,286.00 $3,800.00 $6,698.00 $4,050.00 $9,060.00

Alternate 4 $5,375.00 $7,286.00 $3,860.00 $6,698.00 $3,670.00 $9,060.00

Alternate 5 $5,375.00 $8,286.00 $3,860.00 $6,698.00 $4,050.00 $9,060.00

Alternate 6 0% 1.5% 2% 0% 1% 2%

Waterloo Elementary School

Base Bid $160,922.00 $183,576.00 $323,000.00 $182,815.00 $216,515.00 $150,000.00

Alternate 1 $8,120.00 $8,756.00 $4,200.00 $11,345.00 $3,880.00 $8,000.00

Alternate 2 $11,245.00 $12,322.00 $6,180.00 $16,470.00 $7,655.00 $10,000.00

Alternate 3 $8,620.00 $9,344.00 $4,480.00 $6,434.00 $8,075.00 $7,000.00

Alternate 4 $8,120.00 $7,756.00 $4,480.00 $11,345.00 $3,880.00 $8,000.00

Alternate 5 $8,120.00 $7,756.00 $4,480.00 $11,345.00 $4,230.00 $8,000.00

Alternate 6 $9,370.00 $6,995.00 $4,480.00 $11,345.00 $3,880.00 $6,000.00

Alternate 7 $8,120.00 $9,326.00 $4,480.00 $11,345.00 $3,880.00 $8,000.00

Alternate 8 $8,700.00 $9,326.00 $4,480.00 $11,345.00 $3,880.00 $8,000.00

Alternate 9 $8,700.00 $10,409.00 $5,960.00 $5,738.00 $5,240.00 $7,000.00

Alternate 10 $11,245.00 $14,301.00 $7,250.00 $14,255.00 $5,105.00 $9,000.00

Alternate 11 $11,245.00 $14,301.00 $7,250.00 $14,255.00 $5,105.00 $9,000.00

Alternate 12 0% 1.5% 2% 0% 1% 2%

Worthington Elementary School

Base Bid $294,253.00 $232,888.00 $349,000.00 No Bid $294,900.00 $218,000.00

Alternate 1 $9,435.00 $7,351.00 $5,980.00 No Bid $6,440.00 $7,500.00

Alternate 2 $9,435.00 $8,873.00 $5,980.00 No Bid $6,440.00 $7,500.00

Alternate 3 $9,435.00 $7,199.00 $6,100.00 No Bid $8,940.00 $7,500.00

Alternate 4 $9,435.00 $8,873.00 $6,135.00 No Bid $6,380.00 $7,500.00

Alternate 5 $6,260.00 $6,742.00 $5,980.00 No Bid $7,010.00 $7,000.00

Alternate 6 $6,260.00 $6,742.00 $5,980.00 No Bid $6,380.00 $7,000.00

Alternate 7 $9,435.00 $7,873.00 $5,780.00 No Bid $6,380.00 $7,500.00

Alternate 8 $9,435.00 $6,351.00 $5,780.00 No Bid $6,380.00 $7,500.00

Alternate 9 $9,435.00 $6,351.00 $5,980.00 No Bid $6,380.00 $7,500.00

Alternate 10 $9,435.00 $6,275.00 $5,565.00 No Bid $6,380.00 $7,500.00

Alternate 11 $9,800.00 $5,742.00 $5,565.00 No Bid $5,900.00 $9,000.00

Alternate 12 $9,800.00 $5,742.00 $5,781.00 No Bid $5,900.00 $9,000.00

Alternate 13 $5,435.00 $6,000.00 $5,781.00 No Bid $4,670.00 $7,000.00

Alternate 14 $5,435.00 $5,742.00 $5,860.00 No Bid $5,070.00 $7,000.00

Alternate 15 $5,435.00 $5,690.00 $5,860.00 No Bid $4,810.00 $7,000.00

Alternate 16 $5,435.00 $5,900.00 $4,980.00 No Bid $5,200.00 $7,000.00

Alternate 17 0% 1% 2% No Bid 1% 2%
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