
Bid Tab 5/10/2021
Bid #034.21.B3 10:01 AM
School Bus Service for 
Athletics & Allied Sport Events

School Monthly Rate 

Total Inclusive 
Rate                     

(10 Months) Monthly Rate 

Total Inclusive 
Rate                     

(10 Months) Monthly Rate 

Total Inclusive 
Rate                     

(10 Months) Monthly Rate 

Total Inclusive 
Rate                     

(10 Months)

1 Atholton HS $8,200.00 $82,000.00 Non Bid No Bid $13,000.00 $130,000.00 No Bid No Bid

2 Centennial HS $9,500.00 $95,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9,481.00 $94,810.00

3 Gleneld HS $9,500.00 $95,000.00 $12,350.00 $123,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4 Hammond HS $8,700.00 $87,000.00 No Bid No Bid $13,000.00 $130,000.00 No Bid No Bid

5 Howard HS $9,300.00 $93,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9,481.00 $94,810.00

6 Long Reach HS $9,300.00 $93,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9,481.00 $94,810.00

7 Marriotts Ridge HS $9,500.00 $95,000.00 $12,350.00 $123,500.00 No Bid No Bid $9,975.00 $99,750.00

8 Mt. Hebron HS $9,500.00 $95,000.00 $12,350.00 $123,500.00 No Bid No Bid $9,481.00 $94,810.00

9 Oakland Mills HS $9,300.00 $93,000.00 No Bid No Bid $13,000.00 $130,000.00 $9,481.00 $94,810.00

10 Reservoir HS $8,500.00 $85,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

11 River Hill HS $8,700.00 $87,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9,975.00 $99,750.00

12 Wilde Lake HS $8,500.00 $85,000.00 No Bid No Bid $13,000.00 $130,000.00 No Bid No Bid

Woodlawn Motor Coach, Inc. (4)Bowens Bus Service, Inc.     (3)
Blue Horizons                               

(4)
Mellors Bus Service, Inc.     (3)
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