
Bid #016.22.B3 10/19/2021
Large Kitchen Equipment 10:01 AM

Item # Item Specifications (or Approved Equal) Est. 
Quantity X

Unit Price Total Cost Unit Price Total Cost Unit Price Total Cost Unit Price Total Cost

1 Convection Oven (Double Full Size Electric)
2 X $31,125.00 $62,250.00 $26,716.97 $53,432.74 $28,574.48 $57,148.96 $14,871.12 $29,742.24

Manufacturer - Blodgett
Model Number: HV 100E

2 Convection Oven (Single Stack Electric)
2 X $7,124.00 $14,248.00 $4,681.66 $9,363.32 $6,394.68 $12,789.36 $4,638.90 $9,277.80

Manufacturer:  Blodgett
Model Number: SHO-100-E SGL

3 Convection Oven (Double Full Size Gas)
3 X $23,572.00 $70,716.00 $19,583.15 $58,749.45 $13,974.48 $71,923.44 $23,588.50 $70,766.70

Manufacturer: Blodgett
Model Number: DFG-100-ES

4 Milk Cooler
8 X $4,350.00 $34,800.00 $2,545.45 $20,363.60 $3,305.41 $26,443.28 $3,102.23 $24,817.96

Manufacturer: Beverage Air
Model Number: SM34HC-S

5 Ice Machine
4 X $9,250.00 $37,000.00 $4,150.92 $16,603.68 $5,793.57 $23,174.28 $3,077.59 $12,310.35

Manufacturer - Manitowoc
Model Number: IYT0450A Indigo NXT

6 Reach in Refrigerator - 2 door
4 X $7,575.00 $30,300.00 $9,997.70 $39,990.80 $15,882.27 $63,529.08 $16,080.91 $64,323.64

Manufacturer: Traulsen
Model Number: AHT232WUT-HHS

7 Reach In Freezer -2 door
4 X $4,075.00 $16,300.00 $5,446.29 $21,785.16 $7,156.79 $28,627.16 $7,637.79 $30,551.16

Manufacturer - Traulsen
Model number : G22110

8 Booster Water Heater 480V 3PH
2 $6,950.00 $13,500.00 $4,209.80 $8,419.60 $5,117.30 $10,234.60 $3,566.45 $7,132.91

Manufacturer: Hatco
Model Number: C-54

9 Dishwasher
2 X $19,700.03 $36,400.06 $18,340.92 $36,681.64 $28,908.05 $57,816.10 $22,440.01 $44,880.02

Manufacturer - Hobart
Model Number: AM15VLT-2 

10 Dishwasher 2 X $18,515.01 $37,030.02 $18,340.82 $36,681.64 $30,072.43 $60,144.86 $23,705.12 $47,410.24
Manufacturer: Hobart
Model Number - AM15VLT-4 

11a Dishwasher 3 X $66,916.69 $200,750.97 $36,440.73 $109,322.19 $47,942.82 $143,828.46 $14,423.70 $43,271.10
Manufacturer: Champion
Model Number - 44 PRO VHR Electric

11b Dishwasher 3 X No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $47,942.82 $143,828.46 No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: Champion
Model Number - 44 PRO VHR Electric

11c Dishwasher 3 X No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $47,942.82 $143,828.46 No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: Champion
Model Number - 44 PRO VHR Electric

12 Booster Heater - 208 V / 3PH 3 X $6,117.00 $18,351.00 $4,262.05 $12,786.15 $5,217.05 $15,651.15 $4,029.18 $12,087.53
Manufacturer: Hatco
Model Number - C-54 

13 Display Cabinets 6 X $5,417.00 $32,502.00 $4,157.25 $24,943.50 $4,592.25 $27,553.50 $4,396.95 $26,381.73
Manufacturer: Hatco
Model Number - FSCDH-2PD 

14 Glass Door Merchandiser - One Swing Door 4 X $3,494.00 $13,976.00 $2,618.52 $10,474.08 $4,843.59 $19,374.36 $1,682.23 $6,728.93
Manufacturer: Avantco
Model Number - GDC-12F-HC 

15 Full Height Insulated Pass Thru Mobile Heated Cabinet 
w/(15) Pan capacity 4 X $8,148.00 $32,592.00 $6,000.44 $24,001.76 $7,050.55 $28,202.20 $7,744.62 $30,978.48
Manufacturer: Vulcan
Model Number - VPT15SL 
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