
LARGE KITCHEN EQUIPMENT
Bid Tab 031.23.B3

Item # Item Specifications (or Approved Equal) Est. 
Quantity X

Unit Price
=

Total Cost      Unit Price
=

Total Cost      Unit Price
=

Total Cost      

1 Milk Cooler
8 X $4,285.00 = $34,280.00 $2,744.36 = $21,954.88 $2,908.10 = $23,264.80

Manufacturer: Beverage Air
Model Number: SM34HC-S

2 Reach in Refrigerator - 2 door
3 X $17,390.00 = $52,170.00 $16,631.89 = $49,895.67 $18,562.73 = $55,688.19

Manufacturer: Traulsen (or approved equal)
Model Number: AHT232WUT-HHS

3 Reach In Freezer -2 door
3 X $7,295.00 = $21,885.00 $5,972.10 = $17,916.30 $7,199.34 = $21,598.02

Manufacturer: Traulsen (or approved equal)
Model number : G22110

4 Dishwasher
2 X $22,000.00 = $44,000.00 $23,869.43 = $47,738.86 $28,218.76 = $56,437.52

Manufacturer: Hobart (or approved equal)
Model Number: AM15VLT-2 

5 Dishwasher
2 X $22,000.00 = $44,000.00 $26,999.01 = $53,998.02 $28,218.76 = $56,437.52

Manufacturer: Hobart (or approved equal)
Model Number: AM15VLT-2 

6
Full Height Insulated Pass Thru Mobile Heated Cabinet w/ (15) Pan 
Capacity 2 X $7,865.00 = $15,730.00 $6,695.58 = $13,391.16 $7,418.93 = $14,837.86
Manufacturer: Traulsen
Model Number: AHT232WUT-HHS
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LARGE KITCHEN EQUIPMENT
Bid Tab 031.23.B3

Item # Item Specifications (or Approved Equal) Est. 
Quantity

1 Milk Cooler
8

Manufacturer: Beverage Air
Model Number: SM34HC-S

2 Reach in Refrigerator - 2 door
3

Manufacturer: Traulsen (or approved equal)
Model Number: AHT232WUT-HHS

3 Reach In Freezer -2 door
3

Manufacturer: Traulsen (or approved equal)
Model number : G22110

4 Dishwasher
2

Manufacturer: Hobart (or approved equal)
Model Number: AM15VLT-2 

5 Dishwasher
2

Manufacturer: Hobart (or approved equal)
Model Number: AM15VLT-2 

6
Full Height Insulated Pass Thru Mobile Heated Cabinet w/ (15) Pan 
Capacity 2
Manufacturer: Traulsen
Model Number: AHT232WUT-HHS

Bid# 031.23.B3
Large Kitchen Equipment

Unit Price
=

Total Cost      Unit Price
=

Total Cost      

$2,891.00 = $23,128.00 $3,291.71 = $26,333.68

$15,183.20 = $45,549.60 $19,107.55 = $57,322.65

$6,936.54 = $20,809.62 $8,015.05 = $24,045.15

NO BID = NO BID $25,751.18 = $51,502.36

NO BID = NO BID $25,750.35 = $51,500.70

$7,586.15 = $15,172.30 $7,208.75 = $14,417.50

Singer Ashland TII
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