
Gassant ACME Penn Jersey My EcoPlanet
Item # Unit of 

Measure 
(UOM)

Est. Qty Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

1 ALUMINUM FOIL Case 25 No Bid $55.00 $61.23 No Bid

Size: 0.0007 mil. Thickness

Style: Individual cutter box

Standard: Reynolds #615 or Tenneco #TP-W17 or 
Approved Equal

2 APRONS, PLASTIC Cases 25 No Bid $6.95 $5.59 No Bid

Size: 46"L (w/bib) x 28" w/ties

Style: Bib with ties, white in color

Standard: National Poly Products #E-200 or Ansell 
Edward #54293 or Approved Equal

3 BAG, LUNCH Bundle 25 No Bid $16.50 $95.40 No Bid
Packed: 6-500 per bundle

Size: 5 lb., 5-1/2 x 3-1/2" x 10-3/4"

Style: Kraft

Standard: Duro G-5 or Approved Equal

4 BAKING PAN LINERS Box 440 No Bid $47.50 $87.50 No Bid
Packed: 1000 Sheets per box

Size: 16-3/4" x 24-3/8"

Style: Silicone treated, grease- proof

Standard: Tinicum R49 or James River J-275 or 
Approved Equal

5 CUP, JUICE, 5 OZ. Cases 280 No Bid $65.00 $52.59 No Bid
Packed: 2500 per case

Size: 5 oz.
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Style: Round styrene opaque, waterproof

Standard: Fabrikal FK5 or Dart 5N25 or Approved 
Equal

6 HOT FOOD CONTAINER - NO LIDS Cases 110 No Bid $37.56 $79.11 No Bid
Packed: 1000 per case

Size: 12 oz.

Style: Clear Plastic Polypropylene (PPL)

Standard: Must fit securely to Item #8 (bowl). 
Eatery Essentials or Approved Equal

7 LID FOR 5 OZ. JUICE CUP Cases 20 No Bid $39.00 $33.25 No Bid
Packed: 2500 per case

Size: To fit 5 oz. cup, Item #5

Style: Plastic snap-on lid

Standard: Fabrikal FKL5 or Dart L7N25 or Approved 
Equal

8 SOUP BOWLS - 12 OZ. Cases 110 No Bid $80.00 $152.73 No Bid
Packed: 1000 per case

Size: 12 oz. bowl

Style: Paper, designed to hold hot or cold 
liquids, bowl shape

Standard: Dart 10B20 Bowl. Must fit securely in at 
least 1 compartment of Tray, School 
Lunch Type (Item #26) - Tenneco TH1-
0500 tray. Chinet/Hukamaki or Approved 
Equal

9 FORKS, PLASTIC Cases 1430 No Bid $8.95 $26.50 No Bid
Packed: 1000 forks per case

Size: 12 lbs. minimum weight per case

Style:

Standard: Dart Stylesetter F6BW/Chesapeake or 
Approved Equal

10 KNIVES, PLASTIC Cases 240 No Bid $8.95 $26.50 No Bid
Packed: 1000 Knives per case

Size: 10.2 minimum weight per case
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Style: Serrated edge

Standard: Dart Stylesetter K6BW or Approved Equal

11 TEASPOONS, PLASTIC Cases 1700 No Bid $8.95 $26.50 No Bid
Packed: 1000 teaspoons per case

Size: 12 lb. minimum weight per case

Style:

Standard: Dark Stylesetter S6BW/Chesapeake or 
Approved Equal

12 GLOVES, DISPOSABLE (SMALL) Boxes 50 No Bid $21.00 $6.30 No Bid
Packed: 10/100 per case

Size: Standard length of 2.5 millimeter gauge 

Style: Polyethylene, watertight, chemical and 
alkali resistant and sanitary

Standard: Impact/Handguard or Approved Equal

13 GLOVES, DISPOSABLE (MEDIUM) Boxes 270 No Bid $21.00 $6.30 No Bid
Packed: 10/100 per case

Size: Standard length of 2.5 millimeter gauge 

Style: Polyethylene, watertight, chemical and 
alkali resistant and sanitary

Standard: Impact/Handguard or Approved Equal

14 GLOVES, DISPOSABLE (LARGE) Boxes 265 No Bid $21.00 $6.30 No Bid
Packed: 10/100 per case

Size: Standard length of 2.5 millimeter gauge 

Style: Polyethylene, watertight, chemical and 
alkali resistant and sanitary

Standard: Impact/Handguard or Approved Equal

15 GLOVES, DISPOSABLE (EXTRA LARGE) Boxes 50 No Bid $21.00 $6.30 No Bid
Packed: 10/100 per case

Size: Standard length of 2.5 millimeter gauge 
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Style: Polyethylene, watertight, chemical and 
alkali resistant and sanitary

Standard: Impact/Handguard or Approved Equal

16 NAPKINS, PAPER, DISPENSER Cases 720 No Bid $42.50 $38.04 No Bid
Packed: 200 napkins per package, 50 packages per 

case
Size: 8" x 13-1/2"

Style: Semi-crepe; bleached, 12 lb. stock, size to 
fit tall dispenser

Standard: Fort Howard #332 or Cascades or 
Approved Equal

17 PLASTIC WRAP Rolls 60 No Bid $20.75 $31.62 No Bid
Packed: 18" x 3000' per roll, dispenser cutter box

Size: 50 gauge

Style: Food service plastic film wrap with metal 
serrated cutter, 1 ct.

Standard: Reynolds #915 or Approved Equal

18 SANDWICH BAG, FILP TOP Cases 380 No Bid $17.50 $10.29 No Bid
Packed: 2000 per case

Size: 8" x 5" 

Style: SB85

Standard: Handguard SB85 or Approved Equal

19 FOIL WRAP, INSULTAED Cases 20 No Bid $135.00 $128.51 No Bid
Packed: 50 sheets per package, 5 packages per 

case
Size:  10-3/4" x 13"

Style: Consist of a foil/paper laminate that 
creates a thermal barrier.  Imprinted with 
Logo "Eat to Learn…..Learn to Eat"

Standard: Reynolds "Cushion Fold"' 7531 (red) or 
Approved Equal

20 STRAWS, WRAPPED Cases 140 No Bid $57.50 $71.27 No Bid
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Packed: 500 straws per box, 25 boxes per case 

Size: 5-3/4" to 6" in length, slim, milk straw

Style: Plastic, wrapped

Standard: Must be in accordance with the standards 
established by the Drinking Straw 
Institute.  Sweetheart #811TC, Solo, Dart, 
or Approved Equal

21 STRAWS, WRAPPED (BIODEGRADABLE) Cases 500 No Bid $125.00 $29.69 No Bid
Packed: 500 straws per box, 25 boxes per case 

Size: 5-3/4" to 6" in length, slim, milk straw

Style: Biodegradable, durable, plain white 
(individually wrapped)

Standard: Certified by the Biodegradable Products 
Institute

22 SPORK, NAPKIN, STRAW KIT Cases 40 No Bid $19.50 $18.89 No Bid
Packed: 100 per case

Size: 6" Medium Weight polypropylene plastic 
spork, 5.5" white sip straw and paper 
napkin.

Style: Wrapped spork Napkin Straw individually 
celo-wrapped disposable utensil kit; 
break-resistant, medium-weight plastic. 

Standard: Meets FDA standards for contact with 
food.

23 CLEAR HINGED SANDWICH WEDGE Cases 110 No Bid $47.50 $55.66 No Bid
Packed: 250 per case

Size: 6.63" x 3.56" x 3.52"/16.8cm x 9cm x 
8.9cm
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Style: Clear hinged lid with clear base for fresh 
and chilled sandwiches made of RPET-
Recycled Post-Consumer Polyethylene 
Terephthalate #1 PET, used for Cold 
Foods.  Refrigerated Foods, Freezer Case, 
Fresh Display and Bakery Products. 

Standard: Meets FDA standards for contact with 
food. 

24 RECLOSABLE STORAGE BAGS Cases 80 No Bid $16.50 $13.20 No Bid
Packed: 250 per case

Size: 1 Gallon bag; 10.5" W x 11" L x 1.75 mil 
thick.  

Style: Clear reclosable polyethylene food bags 
with double zipper and white write-on 
block.

Standard: Meets FDA standards for contact with 
food. 

25 ZIP LOCK STORAGE BAGS Cases 80 No Bid $19.50 $16.89 No Bid
Packed: 1000 per case

Size: 6" x 6"

Style: Clear reclosable polyethylene food bags 
with double zipper

Standard: Meets FDA standards for contact with 
food. 

26 TRAY, SCHOOL LUNCH TYPE Cases 14300 $34.00 $24.80 $23.55 $26.99
Packed: 240 trays per case

Size: 8-1/4" x 10-3/8" x 1"

Style: Five compartment, natural, water 
resistant, non absorbent, cut resistant, 
100% compostable, made from a 
renewable resource, made with 100% 
recycled paper, made in the USA.

Standard: Savaday by Chinet or Approved Equal

27 INSERT, DISPOSABLE Cases 50 No Bid $97.00 $67.10 No Bid
Packed: 2500 per case
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Size: 3-1/2" x 3-1/2" x 1", 5 fluid oz. capacity to 
brim, designed to fit at least three 
compartments of the five compartment 
small lunch tray as described in Item #26. 

Style: 10 millimeter gauge, hard plastic, net 
weight to be a minimum of 8.76 lbs. per 
case.  Clear in color.

Standard: "Healthguard" brands by Douglas Stephen 
Company 07-350 or Approved Equal

28 WET WIPES Cases 150 No Bid $47.50 $22.72 No Bid
Packed: 150 per case

Size: 13-1/2" x 24"

Style: Non-woven cloth

Standard: Chicopee #8250 or Approved Equal

29 PATTY PAPER Cases 380 No Bid $156.00 $115.18 No Bid
Packed: 1000/box, 24 bx/case

Size: 5-1/2"

Style: 5-1/2 x 5-1/2 patty paper for 
interweaving

Standard: Fort James #512, Georgia Pacific or 
Approved Equal

30 BUNRACK COVER Cases 30 No Bid $20.25 $25.05 No Bid

Packed: 50/case

Size: 52 x 80" 13 Microns

Style: Clear Cover

Standard: IBS Solution or Approved Equal

31 HALF STEAM PAN FOIL LID Cases 10 No Bid $47.90 $24.54 No Bid

Packed: 100/case

Size: 12-3/4 x 10-3/8 

Style: Foil Lid

Standard: HFA or Approved Equal
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32 HALF DEEP STEAM PAN FOIL Cases 10 No Bid $37.85 $48.40 No Bid

Packed: 100/case

Size: 12-3/4 x 10-3/8 x 2-9/16

Style: Foil Pan

Standard: HFA or Approved Equal

33 FULL STEAM PAN MEDIUM Cases 10 No Bid $76.95 $41.03 No Bid

Packed: 50/case

Size: 20-3/4 x 12-13/16 x 3-3/16

Style: Foil Pan

Standard: HFA or Approved Equal

34 FULL SIZE FOIL LID Cases 10 No Bid $45.13 $51.30 No Bid

Packed: 50/case

Size: 20-3/4 x 12-13/16 

Style: Foil Lid

Standard: HFA or Approved Equal

35 CLEAR CAN LINERS Cases 60 No Bid $21.50 $26.82 No Bid
Packed: 250/case

Size: 33 x 39

Style: Clear, non-toxic, food safe

Standard: PL1-4021 or Approved Equal

36 CHLORINE TEST STRIPS Kits 110 No Bid $7.25 $2.05 No Bid
Packed: 200 strips per kit

Size: 3'' length per test strip

Style: Total Chlorine test papers, chemically 
treated to indicate sanitizer levels. Range 
and sensitivity is 10, 50, 100, 200 ppm 
(200 strips).

Standard: LaMotte, LM-4250BJ or Approved Equal

37 BLEACH Cases 100 No Bid $23.50 $10.95 No Bid
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Packed: 1 gallon plastic jug, 6-1 gallons per case

Size: 6/1 gallon

Style: Pure White bleach

Standard: Wonder or equal (minimum 5.25% 
sodium hypo-chlorite) or Approved Equal

38 POT AND PAN SCRUBBER Boxes 30 No Bid $10.50 $7.98 No Bid
Packed: 10 pads per box

Size: 3-1/2" x 5" x 3/4"

Style:

Standard: 3M Company "Pot n Pan Holder" #88 or 
Approved Equal. 

39 SCOURING POWDER Cases 10 No Bid $31.00 No Bid No Bid
Packed: 30 cans per case

Size: 21 oz. per can

Style:

Standard: Webco or Approved Equal.

CLEANING CHEMICALS - ECOLAB or Approved Equal

Item # Unit of 
Measure 
(UOM)

Est. Qty Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

1 OVEN-GRILL CLEANER Cases 30 No Bid $42.60 $42.58 No Bid
Packed: 4/1 gallon containers per case

Size:

Style:

Standard: Ecolab Greasecutter Plus #19513 or 
approved equal  (Note:  Spray Head)

2 Cases 220 No Bid $43.50 $43.55 No Bid

Packed: 4/ 1 gallon containers per case.

Size:

Style:

Standard: Ecolab Limeaway #18700 or approved 
equal.

DELIMER (Non-abrasive liquid acid detergent) 

Product Description & Specifications
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3 POT AND PAN CLEANER Pail 60 No Bid $60.56 $60.24 No Bid
Packed: 5 gallon pail

Size:

Style:

Standard: Ecolab Pantastic #12871 or approved 
equal. (Note:  To be fed directly from 
shipping container by means of an 
automatic feeder into the pot and pan 
sink to provide a complete automatic 
method of detergent control).

4 DISHWASHING MACHINE RINSE ADDITIVE Cases 70 No Bid $101.00 $101.73 No Bid
Packed: 4/ 1 gallon containers per case.

Size:

Style:

Standard: Ecolab Rinse Dry #10942 or approved 
equal

5 LAUNDRY DETERGENT Cases 40 No Bid $55.00 $68.98 No Bid
Packed: 45 lb. case

Size:

Style:

Standard: Ecolab Laundry Perma-Brite #10391 or 
approved equal.  (NOTE:  Powdered)

6 DISHWASHING DETERGENT Cases 240 No Bid $66.00 $66.08 No Bid
Packed: 4/ 8 lb. per case

Size:

Style:

Standard: Ecolab Solid Metal Pro #10751 or 
approved equal. (NOTE:  To be fed 
directly from shipping container by 
means of an automatic feeder into a 
dishwasher to provide a complete 
automatic method of detergent control).
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