
HOURLY RATES Item Vendor Bid/No Bid Decision Not to exceed man-hours Total Cost
Regular Hours Project Manager Barbizon Capitol Bid $95.00 $95.00
Regular Hours Project Manager Parlights Bid $94.50 $94.50
Regular Hours Project Manager Stage Rigging Services, Inc. Bid $100.00 $100.00

Regular Hours Rigging Technician Barbizon Capitol Bid $215.00 $215.00
Regular Hours Rigging Technician Parlights Bid $168.75 $168.75
Regular Hours Rigging Technician Stage Rigging Services, Inc. Bid $90.00 $90.00

Regular Hours Lighting Technician Barbizon Capitol Bid $75.00 $75.00
Regular Hours Lighting Technician Parlights Bid $74.50 $74.50
Regular Hours Lighting Technician Stage Rigging Services, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid

Regular Hours Laborer/Helper Barbizon Capitol Bid $60.00 $60.00
Regular Hours Laborer/Helper Parlights Bid $74.50 $74.50
Regular Hours Laborer/Helper Stage Rigging Services, Inc. Bid $90.00 $90.00

Premium Hours Project Manager Barbizon Capitol Bid $140.00 $140.00
Premium Hours Project Manager Parlights Bid $139.50 $139.50
Premium Hours Project Manager Stage Rigging Services, Inc. Bid $125.00 $125.00

Premium Hours Rigging Technician Barbizon Capitol Bid $260.00 $260.00
Premium Hours Rigging Technician Parlights Bid $253.13 $253.13
Premium Hours Rigging Technician Stage Rigging Services, Inc. Bid $115.00 $115.00

Premium Hours Lighting Technician Barbizon Capitol Bid $120.00 $120.00
Premium Hours Lighting Technician Parlights Bid $119.50 $119.50
Premium Hours Lighting Technician Stage Rigging Services, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
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Premium Hours Laborer/Helper Barbizon Capitol Bid $90.00 $90.00
Premium Hours Laborer/Helper Parlights Bid $89.50 $89.50
Premium Hours Laborer/Helper Stage Rigging Services, Inc. Bid $115.00 $115.00

MARK UP COSTS Item Vendor Bid/No Bid Decision

% over invoice (inclusive 
of freight/handling costs, 
overhead and profit) Total Mark Up (%)

Mark up costs Material Mark Up: Barbizon Capitol Bid 20 20
Mark up costs Material Mark Up: Parlights Bid 25 25
Mark up costs Material Mark Up: Stage Rigging Services, Inc. Bid 15 15

Mark up costs Equipment Rental Mark Up: Barbizon Capitol Bid 0 0
Mark up costs Equipment Rental Mark Up: Parlights Bid 25 25
Mark up costs Equipment Rental Mark Up: Stage Rigging Services, Inc. Bid 10 10

Mark up costs Subcontractor Mark Up: Barbizon Capitol Bid 16 16
Mark up costs Subcontractor Mark Up: Parlights Bid 25 25
Mark up costs Subcontractor Mark Up: Stage Rigging Services, Inc. Bid 10 10

NOTE: This Bid Tabulation is only a statement of pricing and does not reflect bid evaluation or award.
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